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Coordinates and Invoice
Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 12:07 PM
To: Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com>

Hi Taylor,

Happy Friday!

| wanted to check to see if | could receive the corner coordinates today, and any other reporting you can send. | am an
on a deadline and need at least the coordinates before the weekend.

| can wait for the invoice, but would like to settle up on that as well, if possible.
Thanks!

Matt

Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com> Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 12:57 PM
To: Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com>
Cc: Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com>

Hello Matt,

Stacy will be sending you the coordinate values for your lot corners at the end of the day today. Please
note that while these coordinates are accurate enough to aid in the recovery of the monuments, they
are not absolute in relation to the physical location of your corners.

The record of monument forms will be sent into the Recorder’s Office today and | will send you a copy
complete with the Recorder’s stamp once upon recording.

Our accounting staff is out of the office, but | will have an invoice by Monday.
Thank you,

Taylor Moore, PLS
Survey Manager

Enterprise Engineering, Inc.

907.563.3835 Office



907.227.1888 Mobile

mooret@eeiteam.com

[Quoted text hidden]

Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com> Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 1:34 PM
To: Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com>
Cc: Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com>

Matt,

The purpose of this email is to notify you that as of July 28, 2017, Enterprise Engineering, Inc. has
completed the boundary survey of the subject parcel, legally described as Tract 3, Potter Creek
Subdivision, per Plat No. 71-202. While conducting this boundary survey, the two southern property
corners were recovered and the two northern corners were determined to be unmonumented/missing.
We recovered monumentation of record on adjacent parcels which were used to compute the location
of and install the monuments on the two northern property corners. Our measurements of recovered
and set monumentation agree record information with little to no discrepancy. Record of Monument
forms for the northern corners, set this survey, are in the process of being recorded with the Alaska
Recorder’s Office and we will provide you with copies of these documents once recorded.

Please let me know if you have any additional questions.

Thank you,

Taylor Moore, PLS
Survey Manager

Enterprise Engineering, Inc.
907.563.3835 Office

907.227.1888 Mobile

mooret@eeiteam.com

From: Taylor Moore

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 12:58 PM

To: 'Matt Cavanaugh' <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com>
Cc: Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com>

Subject: RE: Coordinates and Invoice

Hello Matt,


mailto:mooret@eeiteam.com
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mailto:cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com
mailto:hipsaks@eeiteam.com

Stacy will be sending you the coordinate values for your lot corners at the end of the day today. Please
note that while these coordinates are accurate enough to aid in the recovery of the monuments, they
are not absolute in relation to the physical location of your corners.

The record of monument forms will be sent into the Recorder’s Office today and | will send you a copy
complete with the Recorder’s stamp once upon recording.

Our accounting staff is out of the office, but | will have an invoice by Monday.

Thank you,

Taylor Moore, PLS
Survey Manager

Enterprise Engineering, Inc.
907.563.3835 Office

907.227.1888 Mobile

mooret@eeiteam.com

From: Matt Cavanaugh [mailto:cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 12:08 PM

To: Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com>

Subject: Coordinates and Invoice

Hi Taylor,

[Quoted text hidden]

Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com> Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 5:01 PM
To: "cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com" <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com>
Cc: Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com>

Hi Matt,
See attached,

Let me know if you need anything else.

Stacy #ipoak, PLS
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Professional Land Surveyor

Enterprise Engineering, Inc.
hipsaks@eeiteam.com

From: Taylor Moore

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 12:58 PM

To: Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com>
Cc: Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com>
Subject: RE: Coordinates and Invoice

Hello Matt,

[Quoted text hidden]

ﬂ 9146_170728 Tract 3_LAT LONG.PDF
477K

Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com> Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 7:54 PM
To: Stacy Hipsak <hipsaks@eeiteam.com>
Cc: Taylor Moore <mooret@eeiteam.com>

Hi Stacy,

Very cool, thanks for sending.

Have a great weekend!

Matt

On Fri, Jul 28, 2017 at 7:52 PM Matt Cavanaugh <cavanaugh.matt@gmail.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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